
































































































































31. Employees, Subcontractors, and Agents. All Contractor employees,
subcontractors, or agents performing work under the Contract shall be properly trained
technicians who meet or exceed any specified training qualifications. Upon request,
Contractor shall furnish a copy of technical certification or other proof of qualification.
All employees, subcontractors, or agents performing work under the Contract must
comply with all security and administrative requirements of the Customer. The State
may conduct, and the Contractor shall cooperate in, a security background check or
otherwise assess any employee, subcontractor, or agent furnished by the Contractor. The
State may refuse access to, or require replacement of, any personnel for cause, including,
but not limited to, technical or training qualifications, quality of work, change in security
status, or non-compliance with a Customer’s security or other requirements. Such
approval shall not relieve the Contractor of its obligation to perform all work in
compliance with the Contract. The State may reject and bar from any facility for cause -
any of the Contractor’s employees, subcontractors, or agents.

32. Security and Confidentiality. The Contractor shall comply fully with all security
procedures of the State and Customer in performance of the Contract. The Contractor
shall not divulge to third parties any confidential information obtained by the Contractor
or its agents, distributors, resellers, subcontractors, officers or employees in the course of
performing Contract work, including, but not limited to, security procedures, business
operations information, or commercial proprietary information in the possession of the
State or Customer. The Contractor shall not be required to keep confidential information
or material that is publicly available through no fault of the Contractor, material that the
Contractor developed independently without relying on the State’s or Customer’s
confidential information, or material that is otherwise obtainable under State law as a
public record. To insure confidentiality, the Contractor shall take appropriate steps as to
its personnel, agents, and subcontractors. The warranties of this paragraph shall survive
the Contract.

33.Contractor Employees, Subcontractors, and Other Agents. The Customer and the
State shall take all actions necessary to ensure that Contractor's employees,
subcontractors and other agents are not employees of the State of Florida. Such actions
include, but are not limited to, ensuring that Contractor's employees, subcontractors, and
other agents receive benefits and necessary insurance (health, workers' compensanons,
and unemployment) from an employer other than the State of Florida.

34. Insurance Requirements. During the Contract term, the Contractor at its sole expense
shall provide commercial insurance of such a type and with such terms and limits as may be
reasonably associated with the Contract. Providing and maintaining adequate insurance
coverage is a material obligation of the Contractor. Upon request, the Contractor shall
provide certificate of insurance. The limits of coverage under each policy maintained by the
Contractor shall not be interpreted as limiting the Contractor’s liability and obligations
under the Contract. All insurance policies shall be through insurers authorized or eligible to
write policies in Florida.
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35. Warranty of Authority. Each person signing the Contract warrants that he or she is
duly authorized to do so and to bind the respective party to the Contract.

36. Warranty of Ability to Perform. The Contractor warrants that, to the best of its
knowledge, there is no pending or threatened action, proceeding, or investigation, or any
other legal or financial condition, that would in any way prohibit, restrain, or diminish the
Contractor’s ability to satisfy its Contract obligations. The Contractor warrants that
neither it nor any affiliate is currently on the convicted vendor list maintained pursuant to
section 287.133 of the Florida Statutes, or on any similar list maintained by any other
state or the federal government. The Contractor shall immediately notify the Customer in
writing if its ability to perform is compromised in any manner during the term of the
Contract.

37. Notices. All notices required under the Contract shall be delivered by certified mail,
return receipt requested, by reputable air courier service, or by personal delivery to the
agency designee identified in the original solicitation, or as otherwise identified by the
Customer. Notices to the Contractor shall be delivered to the person who signs the
Contract. Either designated recipient may notify the other, in writing, if someone else is
designated to receive notice.

38. Leases and Installment Purchases. Prior approval of the Chief Financial Officer (as
defined in Section 17.001, F.8.) is required for State agencies to enter into or to extend

any lease or installment-purchase agreement in excess of the Category Two amount
established by section 287.017 of the Florida Statutes.

39. Prison Rehabilitative Industries and Diversified Enterprises, Inc. (PRIDE).
Section 946.515(2), F.S. requires the following statement to be included in the
solicitation: "It is expressly understood and agreed that any articles which are the subject
of, or required to carry out, the Contract shall be purchased from the corporation
identified under Chapter 946 of the Florida Statutes (PRIDE) in the same manner and
under the same procedures set forth in section 946.515(2) and (4) of the Florida Statutes;
and for purposes of the Contract the person, firm, or other business entity carrying out the
provisions of the Contract shall be deemed to be substituted for the agency insofar as
dealings with such corporation are concerned.” Additional information about PRIDE and
the products it offers is available at http://www.pridefl.com.

40. Products Available from the Blind or Other Handicapped. Section 413.036(3),
F.S. requires the following statement to be included in the solicitation: "It is expressly
understood and agreed that any articles that are the subject of, or required to carry out,
this contract shall be purchased from a nonprofit agency for the Blind or for the Severely
Handicapped that is qualified pursuant to Chapter 413, Florida Statutes, in the same
manner and under the same procedures set forth in section 413.036(1) and (2), Florida
Statutes; and for purposes of this contract the person, firm, or other business entity
carrying out the provisions of this contract shall be deemed to be substituted for the State
agency insofar as dealings with such qualified nonprofit agency are concemned.”
Additional information about the designated nonprofit agency and the products it offers is
available at http://www.respectofflorida.org.
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41. Modification of Terms. The Contract contains all the terms and conditions agreed
upon by the parties, which terms-and conditions shall govern all transactions between the
Customer and the Contractor. The Contract may only be modified or amended upon
mutual written agreement of the Customer and the Contractor. No oral agreements or
representations shall be valid or binding upon the Customer or the Contractor. No
alteration or modification of the Contract terms, including substitution of product, shall
be valid or binding against the Customer. The Contractor may not unilaterally modify
the terms of the Contract by affixing additional terms to product upon delivery (e.g.,
attachment or inclusion of standard preprinted forms, product literature, “shrink wrap”
terms accompanying or affixed to a product, whether written or electronic) or by
incorporating such terms onto the Contractor’s order or fiscal forms or other documents
forwarded by the Contractor for payment. The Customer's acceptance of product or
processing of documentation on forms furnished by the Contractor for approval or
payment shall not constitute acceptance of the proposed modification to terms and
conditions.

42, Cooperative Purchasing. Pursuant to their own governing laws, and subject to the
agreement of the Contractor, other entities may be permitted to make purchases at the
terms and conditions contained herein. Non-Customer purchases are independent of the
agreement between Customer and Contractor, and Customer shall not be a party to any
transaction between the Contractor and any other purchaser.

State agencies wishing to make purchases from this agreement are required to follow the
provisions of s. 287.042(16)(a), F.S. This statute requires the Department of Management
Services to determine that the requestor's use of the contract is cost-effective and in the
best interest of the State.

43, Waiver. The delay or failure by the Customer to exercise or enforce any of its rights
under this Contract shall not constitute or be deemed a waiver of the Customer’s right
thereafter to enforce those rights, nor shall any single or partial exercise of any such right
preclude any other or further exercise thereof or the exercise of any other right.

44, Annual Appropriations. The State’s performance and obligation to pay under this
contract are contingent upon an annual appropriation by the Legislature.

45, Execution in Counterparts. The Contract may be executed in counterparts, each of
which shall be an original and all of which shall constitute but one and the same
instrument.

46. Severability. If a court deems any provision of the Contract void or unenforceable,
that provision shall be enforced only to the extent that it is not in violation of law or is not
otherwise unenforceable and all other provisions shall remain in full force and effect.
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ATTACHMENT “G”
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State of Florida
PUR 1001
General Instructions to Respondents

Contents

1. Definitions.

2. General Instructions.

3. Electronic Submission of Responses

4. Terms and Conditions.

5. Questions.

6. Conflict of Interest.

7. Convicted Vendors.

8. Discriminatory Vendors.

9. Respondent’s Representation and Authorization.
10. Performance Qualifications.

11. Pubiic Opening.

12. Electronic Posting of Notice of Intended Award.
13. Firm Response.

14. Clarifications/Revisions.

15. Minor Irregularities/Right to Reject.

16. Contract Formation.

17. Contract Overlap.

18. Public Records.

19. Protests.

1. Definitions. The definitions found in s. 60A-1.001, F.A.C. shall apply to this
agreement. The following additional terms are also defined:

(a) "Buyer” means the entity that has released the solicitation.

(b) "Procurement Officer” means the Buyer's contracting personnel, as identified in the
Introductory Materials.

(c) "Respondent” means the entity that submits materials to the Buyer in accordance with
these Instructions.

(@) "Response” means the material submitted by the respondent in answering the
solicitation.

(e) "Timeline” means the list of critical dates and actions included in the Introductory
Materials.

2. General Instructions. Potential respondents to the solicitation are encouraged to
carefully review all the materials contained herein and prepare responses accordingly.

3. Electronic Submission of Responses. Respondents are reqmred to submit responses
electronically. For this purpose, all references herein to signatures, signing requirements,
or other required acknowledgments hereby include electronic signature by means of
clicking the "Submit Response” button (or other similar symbol or process) attached to or
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logically associated with the response created by the respondent within
MyFloridaMarketPlace. The respondent agrees that the action of electronically
submitting its response constitutes:
e an electronic signature on the response, generally,
e an electronic signature on any form or section specifically calling for a signature,
and
e an affirmative agreement to any statement contained in the solicitation that
requires a definite confirmation or acknowledgement.

4. Terms and Conditions. All responses are subject to the terms of the following
sections of this solicitation, which, in case of conflict, shall have the order of precedence
listed:,
e Technical Specifications,
Special Conditions,
Instructions to Respondents (PUR 1001),
General Conditions (PUR 1000), and
Introductory Materials.

The Buyer objects to and shall not consider any additional terms or conditions submitted
by a respondent, including any appearing in documents attached as part of a respondent’s
response. In submitting its response, a respondent agrees that any additional terms or
conditions, whether submitted intentionally or inadvertently, shall have no force or effect.
Failure to comply with terms and conditions, including those specifying information that
must be submitted with a response, shall be grounds for rejecting a response.

5. Questions. Respondents shall address all questions regarding this solicitation to the
Procurement Officer. Questions must be submitted via the Q&A Board within
MyFloridaMarketPlace and must be RECEIVED NO LATER THAN the time and date
reflected on the Timeline. Questions shall be answered in accordance with the Timeline,
All questions submitted shall be published and answered in a manner that all respondents
will be able to view. Respondents shall not contact any other employee of the Buyer or
the State for information with respect to this solicitation. Each respondent is responsible
for monitoring the MyFloridaMarketPlace site for new or changing information. The
Buyer shall not be bound by any verbal information or by any written information that is
not contained within the sclicitation documents or formally noticed and issued by the
Buyer's contracting persongel. Questions to the Procurement Officer or to any Buyer
personnel shall not constitute formal protest of the specifications or of the solicitation, a
process addressed in paragraph 19 of these Instructions.

6. Conflict of Interest. This solicitation is subject to chapter 112 of the Florida Statutes.
Respondents shall disclose with their response the name of any officer, director,
employee or other agent who is also an employee of the State. Respondents shall also
disclose the name of any State employee who owns, directly or indirectly, an interest of
five percent (5%) or more in the respondent or its affiliates.
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7. Convicted Vendors. A person or affiliate placed on the convicted vendor list
following a conviction for a public entity crime is prohibited from doing any of the
following for a period of 36 months from the date of being placed on the convicted
vendor list: '

submitting a bid on a contract to provide any goods or services to a public entity;
submitting a bid on a contract with a public entity for the constmctxon or repair of
a public building or public work;

submitting bids on leases of real property to a public entity;

being awarded or performing work as a contractor, supplier, subcontractor, or

. consultant under a contract with any public entity; and

transacting business with any public entity in excess of the Category Two
threshold amount ($25,000) provided in section 287.017 of the Florida Statutes.

8. Discriminatory Vendors. An entity or affiliate placed on the discriminatory vendor
list pursuant to section 287.134 of the Florida Statutes may not:

L.}

submit a bid on a contract to provide any goods or services to a public entity;
submit a bid on a contract with a public entity for the construction or repair of a
public building or public work;

submit bids on leases of real property to a public entity;

be awarded or perform work as a contractor, supplier, sub-contractor, or
consultant under a contract with any public entity; or

transact business with any public entity.

9. Respondent’s Representation and Authorization. In submitting a response, each
" respondent understands, represents, and acknowledges the following (if the respondent
cannot so certify to any of following, the respondent shall submit with its response a
written explanation of why it cannot do so).

(]

The respondent is not currently under suspension or debarment by the State or any
other governmental authority.

To the best of the knowledge of the person signing the response, the respondent,
its affiliates, subsidiaries, directors, officers, and employees are not currently
under investigation by any govermmental authority and have not in the last ten
(10) years been convicted or found liable for any act prohibited by law in any
jurisdiction, involving conspiracy or collusion with respect to bidding on any
public contract. :

To the best of the knowledge of the person signing the response, the respondent -
has no delinquent obligations to the State, including a claim by the State for
liquidated damages under any other contract.

The submission is made in good faith and not pursuant to any agreement or
discussion with, or inducement from, any firm or person to submit a
complementary or other noncompetitive response.

The prices and amounts have been amived at independently and without
consultation, communication, or agreement with any other respondent or potential
respondent; neither the prices nor amounts, actual or approximate, have been
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disclosed to any respondent or potential respondent, and they will not be disclosed
before the solicitation opening. ‘
The respondent has fully informed the Buyer in writing of all convictions of the
firm, its affiliates (as defined in section 287.133(1)(a) of the Florida Statutes), and
all directors, officers, and employees of the firm and its affiliates for violation of
state or federal antitrust laws with respect to a public contract for violation of any
state or federal law involving fraud, bribery, collusion, conspiracy or material
misrepresentation with respect to a public contract. This includes disclosure of
the names of current employees who were convicted of contract crimes while in
the employ of another company.

Neither the respondent nor any person associated with it in the capacity of owner,

partner, director, officer, principal, investigator, project director, manager,

anditor, or position involving the administration of federal funds:

o Has within the preceding three years been convicted of or had a civil
judgment rendered against them or is presently indicted for or otherwise
criminally or civilly charged for: commission of fraud or a criminal offense in
connection with obtaining, attempting to obtain, or performing a federal, state,
or local government transaction or public contract; violation of federal or state
antitrust statutes; or commission of embezzlement, theft, forgery, bribery,
falsification or destruction of records, making false statements, or receiving
stolen property; or

o Has within a three-year period preceding this certification had one or more

 federal, state, or local government contracts terminated for cause or default.

The product offered by the respondent will conform to the specifications without

exception.

The respondent has read and understands the Contract terms and conditions, and

the submission is made in conformance with those terms and conditions.

If an award is made to the respondent, the respondent agrees that it intends to be

legally bound to the Contract that is formed with the State.

The respondent has made a diligent inquiry of its employees and agents

responsible for preparing, approving, or submitting the response, and has been

advised by each of them that he or she has not participated in any communication,
consultation, discussion, agreement, collusion, act or other conduct inconsistent
with any of the statements and representations made in the response.

The respondent shall indemnify, defend, and hold harmless the Buyer and its

employees against any cost, damage, or expense which may be incurred or be

caused by any error in the respondent’s preparation of its bid.

All information provided by, and representations made by, the respondent are

material and important and will be relied upon by the Buyer in awarding the

Contract. Any misstatement shall be treated as fraudulent concealment from the

Buyer of the true facts relating to submission of the bid. A misrepresentation

shall be punishable under law, including, but not limited to, Chapter 817 of the

Florida Statutes.

10. Performance Qualifications. The Buyer reserves the right to investigate or inspect
at any time whether the product, qualifications, or facilities offered by respondent meet
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the Contract requirements. Respondent shall at all times during the Contract term remain
responsive and responsible. Respondent must be prepared, if requested by the Buyer, to
present evidence of experience, ability, and financial standing, as well as a statement as
to plant, machinery, and capacity of the respondent for the production, distribution, and
servicing of the product bid. If the Buyer determines that the conditions of the solicitation
documents are not complied with, or that the product proposed to be furnished does not
meet the specified requirements, or that the qualifications, financial standing, or facilities
are not satisfactory, or that performance is untimely, the Buyer may reject the response or
terminate the Contract. Respondent may be disqualified from receiving awards if
respondent, or anyone in respondent’s employment, has previously failed to perform
satisfactorily in connection with public bidding or contracts. This paragraph shall not
mean or imply that it is obligatory upon the Buyer to make an investigation either before
or after award of the Contract, but should the Buyer elect to do so, respondent is not
relieved from fulfilling all Contract requirements.

11. Public Opening. Responses shall be opened on the date and at the location indicated
on the Timeline. Respondents may, but are not required to, attend. The Buyer may
choose not to announce prices or release other materials pursuant to s. 119.07(6)(m),
Florida Statutes. Any person requiring a special accommodation because of a disability
should contact the Procurement Officer at least five (5) workdays prior to the solicitation
opening. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the Buyer by using the
Florida Relay Service at (800) 955-8771 (TDD).

12. Electronic Posting of Notice of Intended Award. Based on the evaluation, on the
date indicated on the Timeline the Buyer shall electronically post a notice of intended
award at http://fcn.state.flus/fowa vbs/fowa/vbs www.main megu. If the notice of award
is delayed, in lieu of posting the notice of intended award the Buyer shall post a notice of
the delay and a revised date for posting the notice of intended award. Any person who is
adversely affected by the decision shall file with the Buyer a notice of protest within 72
hours after the electronic posting. The Buyer shall not provide tabulations or notices of
" award by telephone.

13. Firm Response. The Buyer may make an award within sixty (60) days after the date
of the opening, during which period responses shall remain firm and shall not be
withdrawn. If award is not made within sixty (60) days, the response shall remain firm
until either the Buyer awards the Contract or the Buyer receives from the respondent
written notice that.the response is withdrawn. Any response that expresses a shorter
duration may, in the Buyer's sole discretion, be accepted or rejected.

14. Clarifications/Revisions. Before award, the Buyer reserves the right to seek
clarifications or request any information deemed necessary for proper evaluation of
submissions from all respondents deemed eligible for Contract award. Failure to provide
requested information may result in rejection of the response.

15. Minor Irregularities/Right to Reject. The Buyer reserves the right to accept or
reject any and all bids, or separable portions thereof, and to waive any minor irregularity,
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technicality, or omission if the Buyer determines that doing so will serve the State’s best
interests. The Buyer may reject any response not subnntted in the manner specified by
the solicitation documents.

16. Contract Formation. The Buyer shall issue a notice of award, if any, to successful
respondent(s), however, no contract shall be formed between respondent and the Buyer
until the Buyer signs the Contract. The Buyer shall not be liable for any costs incurred by
a respondent in preparing or producing its response or for any work performed before the
Contract is effective.

17. Contract Overlap. Respondents shall identify any products covered by this
solicitation that they are currently authorized to furnish under any state term contract. By
entering into the Contract, a Contractor authorizes the Buyer to eliminate duplication
between agreements in the manner the Buyer deems to be in its best interest.

18. Public Records. Article 1, section 24, Florida Constitution, guarantees every person
access to all public records, and Section 119.011, Florida Statutes, provides a broad
definition of public record. As such, all responses to a2 competitive solicitation are public
records unless exempt by law. Any respondent claiming that its response contains
information that is exempt from the public records law shall clearly segregate and mark
that information and provide the specific statutory citation for such exemption.

19. Protests. Any protest concerning this solicitation shall be made in accordance with
sections 120.57(3) and .287.042(2) of the Florida Statutes and chapter 28-110 of the
Florida Administrative Code. Questions to the Procurement Officer shall not constitute
formal notice of a protest. It is the Buyer's intent to ensure that specifications are written
to obtain the best value for the State and that specifications are written to ensure
competitiveness, faimess, necessity and reasonableness in the solicitation process.

Section 120.57(3)b), F.S. and Section 28-110.003, Fla. Admin. Code require that a
notice of protest of the solicitation documents shall be made within seventy-two hours
after the posting of the solicitation.

Section 120.57(3)(a), F.S. requires the following statement to be included in the
solicitation: "Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3),
Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida
Statutes."

Section 28-110.005, Fla. Admin. Code requires the following statement to be included in
the solicitation: "Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3),
Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the
time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter
120, Florida Statutes.”
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OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL

THE CAPITOL

Reply to:

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32399-1050

Office of the Attorney General

CHARLIE CRIST Genernl Services Division
Attorney Gencral (850)414-3416; SunCom 994-3416
State of Florlda

March 18, 2005

Addendum #1
ITB 04/05-4
Court Reporting Services

Dear Sir or Madam:
ITB 04/05-4 has been changed as indicated herein:

PRICE SHEETS: Page 14, TRANSCRIPTS, 3-5 working day delivery has been
changed to 5 day delivery.

PRICE SHEETS: Page 13 and 14, The columns headed Weight and Only are for the
OAG use only, please do not enter any informalion into that space.

PRICE SHEETS: Page 15. Add h. Video Conferencing per hour. Please submit a bid if
you choose

CONTRACT AWARD: Page 7 & 8, the term price and cost are the same in reference to
this section.

ATTACHMENT “B”;: Page 16, B, The last sentence The same is true for 2 day
appearance is deleted.

ATTACHMENT “B”: Page 20, C, Proper notice is defined as two business days. The
reporter will call the Agency and ask for a fax number and the notification will be made
in writing.

PRICE SHEETS: Page 15, add i. Weekends and holidays per hour and % day for Court
Hearing/Trials DOAH/Board and public meetings. Please submit a bid if you choose.

CHECK LIST: Page 10, Number 1, Invitation to Bid (Bidder acknowledgment form is
deleted. The form has been discontinued .

SCOPE: Page 4, the contract period has been changed to *‘start on or about June 1, 2005
and terminate on June 30, 2008. The contract may be renewed for up to two (2) three
year periods”.

SCOPE: Page 4, add the following language. VYENDOR REGISTRATION:
Any Bidder that is subject to an award under this ITB must be registered with the State of
Florida at MyFloridaMarketPlace.com. On-line registration can be completed at:
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https://vendor.myfloridamarketplace.com/

Bidders requiring registration assistance may call the Vendor Help Desk at 1-866-352-
3776 or contact the OAG purchasing office at 850-414-3417.

MyFloridaMarketPlace TRANSACTION FEE:

This competitive solicitation is subject to the MyFloridaMarketPlace Transaction Fee,
pursuant to Rule 60A-1.031, Florida Administrative Code, which can be accessed at:

http://marketplace.myflorida,com/related/Rule%2060A-1,031 . pdf

A copy of the transactions fee form (PUR 3776) can be accessed at:

http://marketplace.myflorida.com/related/PUR%203776.pdf

Please sign this addendum and return with your bid package.

Sincerely 4/%5/6_‘1:6/}/V (OOKT K%@@f/{/ﬁ

Company Name

Steven A. Copeland
Purchasing Director Signatére




OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL

THE CAPITOL

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32399-1050 Heply to:
Office of the Attorney Geueral
CHARLIE CRIST General Scrvices Division
Attorney General (850)414-3416; SunCom 994-3416

" State of Florida

March 30, 2005

Addendum #2

ITB 04/05~4

Court Reporting Services

Dear Sir or Madam:

ITB 04/05-4 has been changed as indicated herein:
CHECK LIST: Page 10, Number 6, delete next to last sentence. “Proof of work
experience is letters from at least seven clients, judges, and boards attesting to firms
ability in these areas.

- CHECKLIST: Page 10, Number 7, In the first sentence change seven clients to five
clients.

Please sign this addendum and return with your bid package.

Sincerely

Q ' Company Name
teven A. Copeland ‘W
Purchasing Director Signatute
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THE CAPITOL

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 323991050 Heply for
. , Office of the Attorney Geueral
CHARLIE CRIST General Servlees Division
Attorney General (850)414-3416; SunCom 994-3416

. State of Fla‘n‘da . .

March 31, 2005

Addendum #3

ITB 04/05-4

Court Reporting Services

Dear Sir or Madam:

ITB 04/05-4 has been changed as indicated herein:
CHECK LIST: Page 10, Number 6, in the first sentence “Provide
documentation/certification indicating that your firm has been engaged in continuous
court reporting business including criminal/civil deposition or courtroom work for the last
ten years.” Has been changed to the last five years.

Please sign this addendum and return with your bid package.

Smccrely : v %gfﬂmj

Corapany Name

Steven A. Copelan %% /5 : %A
Purchasing Director Signafute

AN AFFIRMATIVE ACTION/EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER
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ATTACHMENT 2
Court Reporters approved to work for American Court Reporting

Suzette A. Bragg
Cynthia R. Green
April Shaw

Letha Wheeler
Joyce D. Lange
Barbara K. Pawson



10.

11.

ATTACHMENT 3

Prices

Depositions
Appearance fee:
First hour

Each hour after first

Court Hearings/Trials, DOAH Hearings

Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)

Half (') day

(8:00am - 12:00pm, 1:00pm - 5:00pm)
Overtime for full and half day

Board and Public Meetings

Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)

Half (*%2) day

(8:00am - 12:00pm, 1:00pm - 5:00pm)
Overtime for full and half day

Realtime
Appearance Fee

Transcript fee:

Original & one copy

10 working days delivery

(State holidays and weekends excluded)

24 hours delivery
72 hours delivery

5 working day delivery
(State holidays and weekends excluded)

Additional copies

Copies (beyond original and
one copy, or when other side
orders the original)

Exhibits

Telephone reporting

10

$40.00 per hour
$20.00 per hour
$180.00 full day
$100.00 half day
$30.00 per hour
$215.00 full day
$120.00 half day

$30.00 per hour

$175.00 first hour
$100.00 each hour after first

$3.00 per page

$6.00 per page
$5.00 per page

$4.00 per page

$1.00 per page
$0.35 per page

No Bid



ATTACHMENT 3

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

Prices
(continued)
Key word indexing No Bid
Key word indexing No Bid
Transcription from tapes No Bid
Transcription from tapes No Bid
Video Services No Bid



ATTACHMENT 4

QUARTERLY REPORT
Company Name
Quarter date
Date Date Agency Case name Accepted Not
of call of job Jjob description Accepted

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

12



