OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL
CRIME STOPPERS TRUST FUND
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Check the Appropriate Box

10% Emergency Transfer Notice | |

Budget Modification

Modification Number: #11(May)

X

/

BUDGET MODIFICATION

Agency Name:

Crime Stoppers of Columbia County, Inc.

Grant Number:

)

Grant Funding Period: 7/1/2015 Through 6/30/2016 030-15
Budget Modification Current Approved . Amount of i
Notice/Request Budget A c““"ge_l for]  FropesarBudget L
Rewards & Eublic $11,558.68 6085% [ s0.00 $11,558.68 69.85%
Education ‘ /
Operating Expenses $4,990.13 30.15% ‘/ $0.00 / $4,990.13 30.15% /
Salary Expenses $0.00 0.00% J/ $0.00 4 $0.00 0.00% 4
TOTAL: $16,548.81 100.00% _// $0.00 / $16,548.81 100.00%/

*If any percentages are highlighed in red, your Budget Modification will not be processed.

Indicate the Budget Line Item number monies wilf be taken from and list which Budget line item

number monies will be transferred to. (Additional Pages may be added)

From Line Item # Amount | TolLine ltem# || Amount
13 J $325.00 41 / $325.00

20 J| $159.00 41 / $159.00

23 $204.00 41 / $204.00

Total: $688.00 Total: $688.00




OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL
CRIME STOPPERS TRUST FUND

Complete the box below if requesting a Budget Modification. You must provide justification.

We are requesting to create a new line item (#41 Reflective Street Signs) so that we may repair
damaged and faded street signs that have been in place since the 2011-2012 grant year. These signs
promote our tip line and website address and are placed in various neighborhoods throughout our
county. We would also like to request the following transfers: 1) $325.00 from line item #13 (Newspaper)
to line item #41, 2) $159.00 from line item #20 (Door Hangers) to line item #41 and 3) $204.00 from line
item #23 (Posters) to line item #41.

i 1 O«W (u/w(l.

Indicate in the box below what impact this modification will have on your program.

These signs were placed during the 2011-2012 grant year in an effort to promote our program, tip line
and website address. Since that time, some of the signs have been damaged or are extremely faded
and are in need of repair.
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Signature-of Grime Stopper Program Project Director Signature Date
,
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Signaturé OAG Research &Trainiffg Specialist Signature Date

Sl

Approved by OAG Program Admidistrator Signature Date
S //‘ //4
Approved by Bureau Chief, Criminal Justice Programs Signature Date

MAIL TO: Office of the Attorney General, Crime Stoppers, The Capitol, PL-0I, Tallahassee, Fl. 32399-1050




Wl Street Signs
ke | Karen O'Bryan (o Cindy Innocenti 05/14/2016 11:41 AM
Adrian Dillon

Ms Innocenti,

We are in receipt of your organization's modification request. | am requesting one additional piece of
information which you may provide by email. How many signs will be purchased?

Thanks!

Please reply or submit any documents to cstfsupport@myfloridalegal.com

Karen L. O'Bryan, Research and Training Specialist
Crime Stoppers Trust Fund
Office of the Attorney General
Division of Victim Services
and Criminal Justice Programs
PL-01, The Capitol
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1050
Telephone: (850) 414-3362
Fax: (850) 413-0633
fcpti.com
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RE: Street Signs
e Cindy Innocenti
e o
Karen O'Bryan
05/16/2016 03:06 PM
Hide Details
From: Cindy Innocenti <Cindy.Innocenti@columbiasheriff.org>
To: Karen O'Bryan <Karen.OBryan@myfloridalegal.com>
Hi Karen,
I was quoted $48 per sign. We have 14 signs that are faded and or damaged. The amount of money |
requested to transfer will be enough to repair all 14.

Cindy Innocenti

Program Director/Treasurer

Crime Stoppers of Columbia County, Inc.
4917 US Hwy 90 East

Lake City, FL 32055

386-758-1104

PRI g

From: Karen O'Bryan [mailto:Karen.OBryan@myfloridalegal.com]
Sent: Monday, May 16, 2016 10:55 AM

To: Cindy Innocenti

Cc: Shayla Crumity; Danica Fields

Subject: RE: Street Signs

Ms. Innocenti,

| am unable to approve vague language in an application. | will need to confirm that the amount of money
requested will resurface and repair 14 signs.

Thanks!

Please reply or submit any documents to cstfsupport@myfloridalegal.com

Karen L. O'Bryan, Research and Training Specialist
Crime Stoppers Trust Fund
Office of the Attorney General
Division of Victim Services
and Criminal Justice Programs
PL-01, The Capitol
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1050
Telephone: (850) 414-3362
Fax: (850) 413-0633
fcpti.com

Cindy Innocenti ---05/16/2016 09:13:56 AM---Up to 14 signs will be resurfaced and repaired. No new signs will

file:///C:/Users/obryank/AppData/Local/Temp/notesSD3EFE/~web7461.htm 5/16/2016
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be purchased at this time. Since a

From: Cindy Innocenti <Cindy. Innocenti@columbiasheriff.org>
To. Karen O'Bryan <Karen OBryan@myfloridalegal com=>
Date: 05/16/2016 09:13 AM

Subject. RE: Street Signs

Up o 14 signs will be resurfaced and repaired. No new signs will be purchased at this time. Since a few
of the signs that are damaged are still in place. my vendor will determine whether or not they are bevond
repair.

Cindy Innocent

Executive Assistant to the Sherift
Columbia County Sherift's Office
4917 I US Hwy 90

Lake City. FL 32055
386-758-1104

From: Karen O'Bryan [mailto:Karen.OBryan@myfloridalegal.com]
Sent: Saturday, May 14, 2016 11:42 AM

To: Cindy Innocenti

Cc: Adrian Dillon

Subject: Street Signs

Ms Innocenti,

We are in receipt of your organization's modification request. | am requesting one additional piece of information
which you may provide by email. How many signs will be purchased?

Thanks!

Please reply or submit any documents to cstfsupport@myfloridalegal.com

Karen L. O'Bryan, Research and Training Specialist
Crime Stoppers Trust Fund
Office of the Attorney General
Division of Victim Services
and Criminal Justice Programs
PL-01, The Capitol
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1050
Telephone: (850) 414-3362
Fax: (850) 413-0633
fcpti.com
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